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Abstract. “City Walk” is gradually becoming a realistic expression of youth-

subcultural landscape presence and emotional expression in its unique form. 

Most of the information available to the author at present explores the dissemi-

nation effect and path construction of youth urban wanderings, but there is very 

little research on the cultural logic and dissemination mechanism of how this type 

of tourism has emerged. Why do young people rapidly change from the past 

travel style to slow-paced travel in a short period? Is it because people are no 

longer impatient, or is it just the short-lived excitement of the travel fad? In this 

paper, we will try to explore the youth “City Walk” and use it to reflect the spir-

itual pursuit and cultural needs of contemporary youth, as well as to provide cor-

responding opinions on the development of the domestic cultural tourism indus-

try to make a modest contribution. 
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1 Introduction 

By analyzing the connotation and value of youth subculture behind urban strolling. To 

conduct an in-depth study of urban strolling to better understand the characteristics and 

development trend of contemporary youth subculture. “CityWalk” embodies the youth 

group's pursuit of freedom, individuality, and innovation. In “CityWalk”, young people 

can get rid of the constraints of the traditional tourism mode, freely explore the un-

known corners of each city, and discover the neglected beauty. At the same time, “City-

Walk” also provides a platform for young people to show their personalities, record and 

share the stories of the city in their way, and express their unique feelings about the 

city. In addition, “CityWalk” has a certain innovative value, which breaks the tradi-

tional mode of tourism, combines tourism with culture and social elements, and pro-

vides a new life experience for the youth. 

Traveling is the best path for people to enrich their minds and find themselves to 

enhance and satisfy themselves. Different ways of traveling will give people different 
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travel experiences, which people use to enrich their life experiences. As the most crea-
tive group, youth, with their strong desire to explore and learn about travel, have devel-
oped diversified and personalized travel methods, injecting fresh energy into today's 
weak travel market. The self-expression and emotional value of youth is reflected in 
contemporary youth's choice of different types of travel modes, which also provides a 
unique cultural section and observation perspective for interpreting the youth subcul-
ture landscape. 

2 Research Sources 

As Jack Kerouac says in On the Road, You don't think of other people's understandings 
as the nuts and bolts in that you are yourself of great account and proud as a king inside's 
youth are opening up a variety of new ways to travel such as Special Forces trips. From 
“into Zibo to catch the grill” to “the capital of carbohydrates” to “Beijing forty-eight 
hours”, “five days to climb the five mountains”. [1] Strive to hit more attractions and 
taste more local specialties in the shortest possible time. At the same time, another mode 
of travel is also quietly emerging, that is, “City Walk” The opposite of “Special Forces 
Travel”, “City Walk” is more of a slow-paced, aimless, more in-depth digging into the 
corners of the city to deeply appreciate the flavor and charm of the city. “City Walk” 
was first popular in the United Kingdom, at that time ‘City Walk’ was generally con-
sidered to be a pre-planned route, following the narrator's plan of the route, so that the 
accompanying tourists more deeply into the city's architectural style, natural scenery, 
and human history. [2] However, with the popularity of “City Walk” in China, its mean-
ing is slowly changing, it no longer follows the route set in advance, but is more spon-
taneous, wanton, free walking in the urban steel jungle, This kind of immersive travel 
allows travelers to better understand the historical heritage behind each city they arrive 
in and also makes their trip more colorful. [3]  According to the “2023 Tourism Re-
search Report” jointly released by DT Finance and DT Research Institute, 82% of peo-
ple want to try “City Walk” among various new ways of traveling. Moreover, according 
to Xiaohongshu's “2023 Annual Life Trend Observation Report”, young people aged 
24 to 33 are the main force of “CityWalk”. This shows that the young generation with 
distinctive personalities has become the main group of the citywalking trend. 

City Walk”, with its unique form, has gradually become a realistic expression of the 
existence and emotion of the youth subculture landscape. “City Walk” is currently 
spreading rapidly among Chinese youth like a wildfire starting a prairie fire, and count-
less young people are taking to the streets in their own spare time to search for an inch 
corner of the city that belongs to them alone, and to communicate more deeply and 
emotionally with the unfamiliar concrete and steel forest. At present, most of the infor-
mation available to the author explores the communication effects and path construc-
tion of youth urban walking, but little has been done to explore the cultural logic and 
communication mechanism of how this type of tourism arises. This paper will try to 
explore and reflect on the spiritual pursuit and cultural needs of contemporary youth 
starting from youth “city walking”, and put forward corresponding opinions to make a 
modest contribution to the development of the domestic cultural tourism industry. 
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3 Subcultural Landscape of Contemporary Youth City 
Walk Practice 

In such an environment, post-subculture does not carry such strong class attributes as 
the original punk or hip-hop as a form of resistance but instead has slowly become a 
new way of expressing personal identity in a more inclusive way, which emphasizes 
popularity rather than class. In China's modern environment, youth subculture is mov-
ing in the same direction as the mainstream ideology, forming its unique style. Young 
people generally pursue a better life, combine with the mainstream ideology, and absorb 
the best parts of it to bring more happiness to their lives. Therefore, the author pays 
more attention to the construction and identification of youth self-identity based on the 
consumption mode under the perspective of entertainment. 

3.1 Representation of Subcultures 

In traditional societies, youth groups often show a certain degree of deviation from 
mainstream culture. For example, some young people are keen on cyber subculture, 
creating unique language, behaviors, and values in cyberspace that contrast sharply 
with traditional mainstream culture, seeking new cultural experiences and value iden-
tities. This subcultural phenomenon is often ignored or rejected by mainstream culture, 
further emphasizing its marginal nature. 

On the one hand, youth groups express their dissatisfaction with traditional aesthetic 
concepts through unique fashion styles and behaviors. For example, the strange clothes 
and exaggerated hairstyles of punk culture are a subversion of traditional aesthetic 
standards. On the other hand, youth subcultures are also criticizing and reflecting on 
traditional ideas and concepts. For example, some youth subcultures emphasize indi-
vidual freedom and self-expression and oppose traditional notions of authority and so-
cial norms. In the field of music, rock music often expresses dissatisfaction and criti-
cism of social reality with its strong rhythm and rebellious lyrics. 

Most of the contemporary youth grow up in an era of affluent and stable society, and 
most of their families have a “childless” family structure. The rapid development of the 
economy and the unfailing care of their relatives have given them a material environ-
ment far beyond that of their elders at home, and the de-development of the Internet 
has allowed them to “open their eyes to the world”. The de-development of the Internet 
has allowed young people to “open their eyes to the world”. As a result, young people 
are no longer bound to textbooks and choose to explore many paths on their own instead 
of following the rules. But in today's fast-paced world, city walks are an effective way 
for young people to get up close and personal with the city itself. There are two main 
features of such “city walks”: first, unlike the original “city walks”, they have no clear 
destination; young people walk aimlessly and uninhibitedly through the streets, with no 
fixed time, even if it's not during breaks, on their way to and from work, or on their 
way to the city. Even when they are not on their breaks, they can make connections 
with buildings, green spaces, and even pedestrians on their way to and from work. It is 
very flexible in terms of time. Secondly, the “city walk” youth are not confined to the 
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choice of destination, but try to find doorways and courtyards hidden in the depths of 
the city, decipher the city's cultural lineage, go into the hutongs to feel the smoky at-
mosphere of the city, go into the crowds to feel the flavor of life, and search for souls 
in the jungle of reinforced concrete. 
 

4 Decoding the Practical Logic of Contemporary Youth 
City Walk in the Subcultural Landscape 

4.1 Embedding in the Embodiment: Local Ballet under Medium 
Rituals 

“City Walk” is an effective means for contemporary youth to fight against the increas-
ingly fast pace of life, and a subcultural practice to find their true selves in the context 
of a fast-paced life deeply embedded in the social structure. [4] In this regard, anthro-
pologist Xiang Biao, in his viewpoint on “neighborhood”, believes that “neighborhood” 
is an interactive intersection of self-centered circles colliding with others, and that con-
temporary youth should rebuild “neighborhood”. The contemporary youth should re-
build the “neighborhood”. He argues that “Virtual Nearby” is a virtual form of emo-
tionless information-to-information, and that the real “Nearby” should be a way for 
contemporary youth to search for a new way of recognizing themselves in the life 
around them, given the difficulty of balancing the imaginary world and the reality of 
their selves. The real “neighborhood” should be contemporary youth's search for a new 
way to recognize themselves in the life around them, given the difficulty of balancing 
the imaginary world and the reality of themselves. Urban wandering has become a 
unique way for contemporary youth to settle themselves and establish a “neighbor-
hood”. In the digital era, with the rapid development of communication technology, the 
Internet platform has become more and more widespread and influential and has slowly 
become a catalyst for youth subculture practice, its unique inclusiveness and openness 
have made it grow into a new way for generations of young people to express them-
selves, to become themselves, and to realize their values. Streaming media platforms 
help youth subculture spread 

Out of the routine daily life, daily life is a subtle control over the effectiveness of the 
human body's energetic factors and mechanisms; this control continuously makes the 
human body a target to be molded and disciplined; although technology has made life 
more convenient, it seems that the speed of development is too fast for people to put 
down their feet and even stop to enjoy the beautiful scenery on the roadside, but to keep 
moving from city to city, switching scenes like completing a mission. Instead, they keep 
moving from one city to another, switching scenes as if completing a task. In the period 
of accelerated development of modern society, capital began to regard time as a tool 
for manipulating and coordinating laborers, constantly extending their labor time in 
exchange for more surplus value to maximize profits, at this time time time time is like 
a system that compresses the individual's desire for freedom. At the same time, pan-
entertainment has intensified the lack of free time for people, leaving behind what they 
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want to do under the coercion of social time. As free time is compressed and daily life 
begins to become mundane through the alienation of time, youth need and desire special 
moments to break free from daily life, to rescue individuals from boredom, and to ra-
diate the light and heat of life, to generate passion and freedom beyond the ordinary. 
Young people hope to express their desire for free time through themselves, to find and 
create their own time, and to break away from the triviality of daily life through “City 
Walk” in addition to the socially necessary labor time required for daily life.[5]  

4.2 Young People are Gradually Rejecting Consumerism and 
Unreasonable Competition 

In recent years, no matter what industry the young people are in, almost all of them are 
caught in the whirlpool of vicious competition. Contemporary young people are in a 
state of severe competition and excessive self-consumption, which makes young people 
feel a deep sense of powerlessness all the time, at the same time, in the face of the 
complex social environment, it is difficult to find their position, and this powerlessness 
can easily lead to the anxiety of the young people. To get rid of such negative emotions, 
more and more young people choose “City Walk” to release their tense nerves, escape 
from the heavy workload, and let their body and mind get completely relaxed and nour-
ished through the humanistic atmosphere and the fireworks of the city. Through the 
process of roaming to escape from the troubles, embedded in the theme of the city of 
the self, clear self-cognition, and further establish their own life goals and pursuits, to 
achieve self-worth. 

5 Conclusion 

The pace of life is getting faster and faster, competition is getting fiercer and fiercer, 
and youth are getting more and more anxious. Against this backdrop, diversified travel 
methods as a place of rest allow young people to relax and regulate their own pace of 
life briefly. After work or after school, they can take a “City Walk” on a whim, and 
have an unexpected encounter with a little-known corner of the city. City Walk” is 
becoming an important choice for more and more young people in their limited free 
time due to its flexible time and diversified space.” City Walk” participates in the self-
adjustment and cultural construction of the youth subculture landscape by its rational 
way of searching for self-consistency in life behaviors. It provides a unique perspective 
for exploring youth subculture and social space adaptability and also shows that con-
temporary youth subculture no longer rebels against the mainstream society, but 
chooses to integrate into the society while pursuing a unique style and recognizing 
themselves. From this, we can conclude that, under the mechanism of modern network 
media, contemporary youths have stepped out of their homes to leave their marks in 
every corner of the city and have close contact with the city. All of them are trying to 
resist the alienation of time, reject the abnormal competition mode, relieve the anxiety 
of youth, break the constraints, and live a non-competitive reverse life through “City 
Walk”. No longer wrapped up in consumerism, they take the initiative to say goodbye 
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to the unreasonable consumption coaxed up by the merchants, and choose a simple life, 
in harmony with the hippies of the sixties, choosing a lifestyle that is more simple, 
closer to nature, and more aware of their true selves. The popularity of “City Walk” is 
also a kind of effective self-reconciliation for the youth to cope with such a complicated 
and changing social life, and it is also a symbol of the youth group's spreading opposi-
tion to consumerism. Young people are no longer attracted by luxury goods but actively 
choose value for money. In the process of roaming the city, young people recognize 
their true selves, perceive their emotions, think seriously about their lives, express their 
true selves, and express their sense of relaxation and self-gratification in the concrete 
jungle, thus forming a new generation of youth elegant cultural landscape with great 
spatial practical significance. 
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