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Abstract. To be able to enter the world of work, individuals must go 

through a selection process for prospective workers. Readiness for job 

selection is a person's first capital to be able to enter the world of work. 

This research aims to describe the innovation of the "Siap Kerja" pro-

gram to increase job selection readiness for youth. This program innova-

tion was implemented for three (3) days. The first day was material on 

application file administration, the second day was about analyzing one's 

potential for a career and tips for successful interviews, and the third day 

was material about creating personal branding for a career and easy ways 

to find job vacancies. There is a hypothesis test to determine the effec-

tiveness of this program innovation using the Wilcoxon signed-rank test. 

The research results of the "Siap Kerja" program innovation show that 

there is a significant difference between the results of the pre-test group 

and the post-test group so that the "Siap Kerja" program innovation can 

be said to be effective. 
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1 Introduction 

Indonesia is the country with the second highest open unemployment rate in Southeast 
Asia. This is based on data from the Central Statistics Agency of the Republic of Indo-
nesia [1] which released the number of unemployed people in Indonesia as of February 
2023, which was 7.99 million people. The number of unemployed in Indonesia com-
pared to the total workforce reached 5.45%. Other countries with the highest open un-
employment rates in Southeast Asia are Brunei Darussalam at 7.2%, Timor Leste 4.9%, 
and Malaysia 3.4%. Meanwhile, Central Java province has an open unemployment rate 
of 5.24%. The total working age population of Central Java province is 29.12 million 
people with 21.06 million people in the Working Force and 8.06 million people in the 
Non-Working Force. The number of unemployed people in Central Java reached 1.10 
million people. Banyumas Regency, as one of the districts in Central Java province, is  
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in fifth position as the district with the highest number of unemployed people in the 
Central Java region. In sequence, the 5 districts with the highest number of unemployed 
people in Central Java province are Brebes district with 86,501 people, Cilacap district 
with 83,941 people, Semarang city with 81,739 people, Tegal district with 68,576 people 
and Banyumas district with 52,713 people. 

Unemployment occurs partly because there are still many graduates who do not have 
good work readiness. This is shown from data from the Central Statistics Agency as of 
February 2023, 12% or 958,800 graduates were unemployed. Even graduates who com-
petently have knowledge and insight into the scientific field they are studying are still 
unable to get a job. Caballero [2] explains that readiness to enter the world of work (work 
readiness) is defined as the extent to which graduates are considered to have the attitudes 
and attributes to be ready and successful in the world of work. Other causes explained 
by Nurullaili [3] namely, education majors that are not common so that they are less 
popular in the job market, lack of business capital, marriage which ultimately limits ac-
tivities, laziness, and fraudulent practices in the world of work. This makes the process 
of getting a job even more difficult. Nghi and Hien [4] added that a big challenge for 
college graduates is the inability to meet job market requirements. 

Work readiness is a person's first capital to be able to enter the world of work. The 
unequal distribution of education also causes a shortage of competitive human resources 
entering the world of work [5]. To be able to enter the world of work, a person is required 
to go through a selection process for prospective workers. Caballero [6] explains the 
methods generally used in the selection process for prospective workers, namely appli-
cation forms (email, google form), academic achievement, interviews and cognitive abil-
ities which are measured through tests. According to Krishnan et al [7], most graduates 
cannot carry out the interview selection process well. This is also one of the reasons why 
someone does not pass the job application process. These graduates were unable to un-
derstand the interview questions asked so they answered poorly. 

The government has made various efforts to increase job selection readiness for 
youth. One of the programs created is the Pre-Employment Card program. Based on 
research conducted by Siti Dwi Yana [8], she explained that the Pre-Employment Card 
program was considered less effective because registration was carried out online, caus-
ing a number of people to have to use the services of a Pre-Employment agent due to a 
lack of understanding of technology and joining this program did not guarantee that 
someone could immediately get a job. Meanwhile, there is another program called 
Tenaga Kerja Mandiri (TKM) in Purwakarta Regency which is a program to empower 
the unemployed through entrepreneurship training, providing business assistance, and 
regular mentoring by assistant staff. This program was researched by Nisa Maulida 
Nurfaizah [9] and the results showed that the TKM program was not effective. This is 
because the program recipients are not entirely unemployed and there are still people 
who receive the program who do not meet the criteria. The two programs that have been 
implemented by the government have a lack of sustainability in getting jobs and are not 
targeted precisely, so a program is needed that can overcome this. 

Practical training programs and ongoing mentoring are needed by the community, 
especially young people, to prepare prospective workers to enter the world of work. In 
facing an ever-changing and diverse world of work, young people need more thorough 
preparation. Therefore, there is a need for innovative programs to help young people 
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improve their readiness for job selection. This research aims to provide an overview of 
the innovation of the "Siap Kerja" program to increase the job selection readiness of 
youth members of the Karang Taruna Satria Garuda. 

Karang Taruna is a youth organization that has room to develop in terms of educa-
tion, training and community empowerment. Karang Taruna makes a significant contri-
bution to village government work activities. Additionally, other children and young 
people may be motivated to pursue successful careers by the example set by Karang 
Taruna members. As one of the main socio-economic problems in rural areas, youth 
organizations strive to at least avoid unemployment as role models [9]. 

2 Research Approach 

The innovative program called "Siap Kerja" will be implemented for 3 days, namely 
Friday-Sunday, 8-10 December 2023 every time from 07.30-09.00 PM. The subjects of 
this innovative program are young people from members of the Karang Taruna Satria 
Garuda, Karangklesem Village, South Purwokerto, Banyumas, Central Java. Each meet-
ing has a different material topic. The following is the complete description: The first 
activity will be held on Friday 8 December 2023, namely in the form of a pre-test and 
explanation of material regarding tips and tricks for job application administration; The 
second activity was held on Saturday 9 December 2023 with material on self-analysis 
using the talent mapping method and tips and tricks for successful job interviews; The 
third activity was held on Sunday 10 December 2023 with final material on personal 
branding for careers and continued with a post-test. 

The implementation of the "Siap Kerja" training program is a collaboration between 
Karang Taruna Satria Garuda and the Akademi Leader Indonesia. To determine the ef-
fectiveness of this program, there is an effectiveness test using the Wilcoxon signed-
rank test through calculations in SPSS. The proposed hypothesis or Ha = "there is a 
difference in the results of the pre-test and post-test", which means that there is a signif-
icant difference between the results of the pre-test group and the post-test group. 

The data obtained was then analyzed according to the Miles and Huberman analysis 
stages [30] includes data reduction, data presentation and drawing conclusions from the 
data that has been obtained. The results of this analysis are the basis for discussing the 
conditions of learning problems faced by students and analyzing the needs of school 
counselors regarding the characteristics of peer counseling needed to help school 
counselors overcome student learning problems. 

3 Result and Discussion 

3.1 Result 

The innovative "Siap Kerja" program for members of the Karang Taruna Satria Garuda 
has been implemented for 3 consecutive days with a total of 17 participants. The material 
presented includes: Job application administration, self-analysis, tips for successful job 
interviews and how to build personal branding. 
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3.2 Administration of job applications. 

The aim of this first material is to provide education about making correct application 
files and effective techniques in sending application files so that it can make it easier for 
participants to apply for jobs. The first day's material includes how to make a good cur-
riculum vitae, the correct order of compiling application files, the technique of sending 
application files via email, optimizing email for careers and portfolios. Job application 
administration is studied, such as how to make a curriculum vitae properly, the correct 
order of compiling application files, the technique of sending application files via email, 
optimizing emails for careers and portfolios. On this first day, program participants' cur-
riculum vitae was also reviewed to optimize participant administration which will be 
attached when applying for jobs. Here is the documentation on day one: 

 

Fig. 1. First Day Docummentation  

3.3 Self-analysis & Tips for successful job interviews. 

This second material aims to provide an accurate picture of your potential for the career 
you will pursue and provide knowledge about job interviews to make you more confi-
dent. The material provided is about self-analysis using the talent mapping method and 
tips and tricks for successful job interviews. In the self-analysis material, participants are 
directed to carry out a self-analysis test through the online talent mapping portal and this 
can be used as an appropriate career reference. In the interview material, participants are 
given tips for preparing for an interview well, including frequently asked interview ques-
tions and how to answer them. All participants also carried out job interview simulations 
in turns. Here is the documentation for the second day: 
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Fig. 2. Second Day Docummentation  

3.4 Personal branding for career 

This third material aims to equip participants on how to easily find job vacancies and 
also that participants can make good personal branding for their career needs. The final 
material of this program is about how to build good personal branding to support the job 
and career selection process as well as material on how to easily find job vacancies. 
Participants are taught to create a LinkedIn account for their respective professional pro-
files and also practice searching for job vacancy information quickly and easily. After 
the material is finished, participants do a post-test to assess the participants' progress. 
Here is the documentation on day three: 

 

Fig. 2. Third Day Docummentation  
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The effectiveness of the "Siap Kerja" program innovation was tested using the Wil-

coxon signed-rank test through calculations in SPSS. The data used are the results of the 
pre-test and post-test which were completed by training participants who attended the 
class for 3 consecutive days. The pre-test data is referred to as variable 1, while the post-
test data is referred to as variable 2. The following are the results of the calculations: 

Table. 1. Statistical Test Result  

 

 

Based on the "Test Statistics" output above, it is known that Asymp.Sig. (2-tailed) is 
worth 0.00. Because the value of 0.00 is smaller than <0.05, it can be concluded that "Ha 
is accepted", namely that there is a difference in the results of the pre-test and post-test. 
It can be concluded that there is a significant difference between the results of the pre-
test group and the post-test group so that the "Siap Kerja" program innovation can be 
said to be effective. 

3.5 Discussion 

The "Siap Kerja" program innovation was carried out for three (3) consecutive days with 
the aim of increasing job selection readiness for young members of the Satria Garuda 
Karang Taruna, Karangklesem Village, South Purwokerto, Banyumas Regency, Central 
Java. Job selection needs to be prepared carefully to suit the career plans of job appli-
cants. The importance of understanding what needs to be prepared before taking part in 
job selection has been explained in a career theory developed by Frank Parson. 
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This career theory views that individuals who choose a field of work must take three 

important steps. First, understand yourself regarding your talents, interests, strengths, 
weaknesses, etc (self-analysis). Second, individuals have an understanding of the infor-
mation on the requirements that need to be prepared to be able to enter a field of work 
(vocational information). Third, having the ability to rationalize self-understanding with 
vocational information so that individuals can consciously choose the appropriate field 
of work [10]. 

Meanwhile, if you look at career decision making theory, there are three (3) domains 
involved in the career decision making process. The three domains involved are referred 
to as the pyramid of information-processing which includes the knowledge domain, the 
career decision-making skills domain and the executive management domain. 
Knowledge domains consist of knowledge about oneself (self knowledge) and 
knowledge about work (occupational knowledge) [11]. The "Siap Kerja" innovation pro-
gram provides a lot of knowledge and insight into what things need to be prepared and 
optimized before taking part in job selection. So the innovation of the "Siap Kerja" pro-
gram can be said to be included in the knowledge about work (occupational knowledge) 
that a person needs before entering the world of work. 

Several studies regarding job selection preparation that have been carried out show 
how important it is for individual readiness, in this case young people, before taking part 
in selection to enter the world of work. The first research was conducted by Setiyawan 
[12] by conducting training for job selection. The second research was conducted by 
Rahmatica [13] by providing education on CV writing, psychological tests and job in-
terviews for students at SMKN 39 Jakarta. The third research was conducted by Hanarti 
[14] by providing education on job interview strategies and types of work agreements 
for Pkbm Negeri 23 Jakarta students. 

4 Conclusion 

With the innovative program called "Siap Kerja" for the youth of Karang Taruna Satria 
Garuda, it can be concluded: (1) Increased participants' insight into the concept of job 
selection preparation, (2) Increased participants' skills in preparation for job selection, 
such as how to create a curriculum vitae and LinkedIn account for personal branding, 
dan (3) The "Siap Kerja" program innovation is effective in increasing job selection 
readiness as seen from the post-test results which are higher than the post-test for all 
participants who take part in the program 
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